BID: SWA 09-22/PF

Fabrication Services for compost Facility
and Woody Waste Processing System

AWARD RECOMMENDATION

DATE: July 7, 2009

BUYER; Phil Ford
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Item/ BIDDER — Van Linda PB Iren West Gate Cordray ERM of PB WP Machine Pro Energy
1-- Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
A welding 67.00 85.00 85.00 No Bid 60.00 45,00 80.00
B fabrication 67.00 85.00 85.00 No Bid 60.00 45.00 80.00
C Parts Repairs 67.00 85.00 85.00 No Bid 60.00 50.00 80.00
Total 1 A-C inclusive 201(2) (4) 255(2) No Bid 180(2) 140(1) 240(2)
N - .
A Machining 60.00 85.00 75.00 70.00 No Bid 55.00 90.00
B Welding 60.00 75.00 75.00 70.00 No Bid 45,00 70.00
C Fabrication 60.00 75.00 75.00 70.00 No Bid 55.00 70.00
D Shear & Break work 60.00 85.00 75.00 70.00 No Bid 55.00 70.00
E Sheet Metal Work 60.00 85.00 75.00 70.00 No Bid 55.00 70.00
F Laser cutting 60.00 N/A 160.00 70.00 No Bid 60.00 150.00
G Parts Repairs 60.00 75.00 75.00 70.00 No Bid 50.00 70.00
Total 2 A~ G Inclusive 420(2) {5) 610(2) 490(2) No Bid 375(1) 530(2)
Material Markup 12% N/A 30% 20% 20% N/A 10%
Equip rental % Mkup 12% N/A 30% N/A 20% N/A 10%
Service call charge N/A N/A $120 N/A $60 N/A $450
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AWARD RECOMMENDATION
NO BIDS: None

** "Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in
response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as fate.”

KEY (S) FOR RECOMMENDATION:

(1) Recommended award to lowest responsive bidder(s) meeting specifications

(2) NG award, not "lowest" responsive responsible bidder

(3) NO award, did not meet specifications

(4) Reject Bid — Vendor failed to initial corrections as stated in General Conditions #6 MISTAKES.

(9) Reject Bid — Vendor failed to bid on every item within the group as stated in Special Condition #37 AWARD.

SWA 09-22/PF Award Recommendation page 2 of 2



