

# AWARD RECOMMENDATION

**BID: SWA 15-10/NA NAME: Odor Control Chemical Products**

**DATE: 12/18/14 BUYER: N. Appel**

BID ADV:	10/27/14	NA	BID OPENED	12/9/14	NA
PRE-BID CONF.:	11/14/14	NA	DEPARTMENT EVAL:	12/11/14	On file
ADDENDUM #1:	10/30/14	NA	EVALUATION REC'D	12/18/14	NA
ADDENDUM #2	11/21/14	NA	POSTING APPROVED	12/18/14	NA/SB
ADDENDUM #3	11/25/14	NA	DATE BID POSTED	12/18/14	NA

TERM: from 1/2/2015-1/1/2016

 **POSTED**

14 DEC 18 PM 2:14  
 SOLID

LOT 1: <u>North County Landfill, Scented, Liquid</u>			Air Care Tech, LLC (2)	ChemStation of Florida	Ecolo Environmental Inc. (2)	NCM Odor Control (4)	OCP+E, LLC (1)	State Chemical Solutions (2)	Benzaco Scientific Inc. (3)	Industrial Cleaning Equip & Supply (3)	Continental Research Corp (3)
ITEM	/	BIDDER									
A	SL-400 Citrus	5 GAL		No Bid		\$5,164.50					
	Alternate		\$3,592.50		\$9,300.00	No Bid	\$1,650.00	\$6,330.00			
B	107272-Cherry	5 GAL		No Bid		No Bid		\$18,000.00			
	Alternate		\$11,975.00		\$28,000.00	No Bid	\$5,500.00				
C	Sweet Sensation 124989	5 GAL		No Bid		No Bid		\$21,100.00			
	Alternate		\$11,975.00		\$28,000.00	No Bid	\$5,500.00				
D	Cherry 81832	5 GAL		No Bid		No Bid					
	Alternate		\$7,185.00		\$16,800.00	No Bid	\$3,300.00	\$10,800.00			
<b>Annual Cost LOT 1</b>			<b>\$34,727.50</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$82,100.00</b>	<b>\$5,164.50</b>	<b>\$15,950.00</b>	<b>\$56,230.00</b>			

LOT 2: <u>Central County Transfer Station, Scented, Liquid</u>			Air Care Tech, LLC (2)	ChemStation of Florida (4)	Ecolo Environmental Inc. (2)	NCM Odor Control (4)	OCP+E, LLC (1)	State Chemical Solutions (2)	Benzaco Scientific Inc. (3)	Industrial Cleaning Equip & Supply (3)	Continental Research Corp (3)
Item	/	BIDDER									
A	States Cherri-D Odor Eliminator	55 GAL DRUM		No Bid		No Bid		\$9,042.00			
	Alternate		\$6,319.50	No Bid	\$14,850.00	No Bid	\$2,688.00				
B	NCM-SL-4000 Odor Eliminator	55 GAL DRUM		No Bid		\$3,787.30					
	Alternate		\$2,106.50	No Bid	\$4,950.00	No Bid	\$896.00	\$3014.00			
C	Chemstation Odor Eliminator	55 GAL DRUM		No Bid		No Bid					
	Alternate		\$2,106.50	\$2,475.00	\$4,950.00	No Bid	\$896.00	\$3,014.00			
<b>Annual Cost LOT 2</b>			<b>\$10,532.50</b>	<b>\$2,475.00</b>	<b>\$24,750.00</b>	<b>\$3,787.30</b>	<b>\$4,480.00</b>	<b>\$15,070.00</b>			

## AWARD RECOMMENDATION

<b>LOT 3: Central County Transfer Station, Scented, Granular</b>		<b>Air Care Tech, LLC (3)</b>	<b>ChemStation of Florida (4)</b>	<b>Ecolo Environmental Inc. (2)</b>	<b>NCM Odor Control (4)</b>	<b>OCP+E, LLC</b>	<b>State Chemical Solutions (1)</b>	<b>Benzaco Scientific Inc.</b>	<b>Industrial Cleaning Equip&amp; Supply (3)</b>	<b>Continental Research Corp (3)</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>/ BIDDER</b>									
<b>A</b>	<b>States Cherri-D Odor Eliminator</b>		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$11,880.00	No Bid		
	<b>Alternate</b>		No Bid	\$18,480.00	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		
<b>B</b>	<b>NCM-SL-4000 Odor Eliminator</b>		No Bid		\$3,787.30	No Bid		No Bid		
	<b>Alternate</b>		No Bid	\$6,820.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,960.00	No Bid		
<b>C</b>	<b>Chemstation Odor Eliminator</b>		\$2,612.50		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		
	<b>Alternate</b>		No Bid	\$6,820.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,960.00	No Bid		
<b>Annual Cost LOT 3</b>			<b>\$2,612.50</b>	<b>\$32,120.00</b>	<b>\$3,787.30</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$19,800.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>		

<b>LOT 4: South County Transfer Station, Scented, Liquid</b>		<b>Air Care Tech, LLC (2)</b>	<b>ChemStation of Florida</b>	<b>Ecolo Environmental Inc. (2)</b>	<b>NCM Odor Control</b>	<b>OCP+E, LLC (1)</b>	<b>State Chemical Solutions (2)</b>	<b>Benzaco Scientific Inc. (3)</b>	<b>Industrial Cleaning Equip&amp; Supply (3)</b>	<b>Continental Research Corp (3)</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>/ BIDDER</b>									
<b>A</b>	<b>States Cherri-D Odor Eliminator</b>		No Bid		No Bid		\$9,042.00			
	<b>Alternate</b>	\$6,319.50	No Bid	\$14,850.00	No Bid	\$2,688.00				
<b>Annual Cost LOT 4</b>		<b>\$6,319.50</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$14,850.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$2,688.00</b>	<b>\$9,042.00</b>			

No Bid: None

- YES  NO Local preference applied  
 YES  NO SBE

**KEY (S) FOR RECOMMENDATION:**

- (1) Recommended award to lowest responsive, responsible bidder(s) meeting specifications
- (2) NO award, not "lowest" responsive responsible bidder
- (3) Reject Bid. Vendor failed to submit alternate samples per GTC#30 and Bid Form page 2
- (4) Reject bid. Vendor failed to bid every item in lot per STC#47 and Bid Form page 2.