



**PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON FEBRUARY 13, 2019**

**BID OPENING**

<b>Bid No.:</b> 19-402/SLB	<b>DATE:</b> JANUARY 29, 2019	<b>TIME:</b> 9:00 A.M.
<b>BID FOR:</b> SOLID WASTE AND RECYCLING COLLECTION SERVICES		
<b>LOCATION:</b> Solid Waste Authority Administration Building - Auditorium		

BIDDER	SERVICE AREA AWARDED			
	1	2	3	4
Advanced Disposal Services		X		
FCC, SA			X	X
Goode Companies of FL, Inc.				
Republic Services of Florida				
Richard's Disposal				
Waste Management Inc of Florida				
Waste Pro of Florida, Inc.	X			

Bid Award Tabulation attached

***Note: The Cone of Silence shall be in effect as of the deadline to submit Bid even if Bid is withdrawn or is otherwise eliminated from consideration consistent with the procedures as outlined in this Bid. The Cone of Silence shall remain in effect until the Governing Board, or Authority staff, if authorized to act on behalf of the Board, awards or approves the contract, rejects all Bids or otherwise takes action which ends the solicitation process.***

**WITNESS**

\_\_\_\_\_  
Saundra Brady, SWA Purchasing Services

\_\_\_\_\_  
Barbara Novello, SWA Purchasing Services

**Solid Waste Authority of Palm Beach County  
Solid Waste and Recycling Collection Bid Award Schedule  
Contract Term 10/1/19 - 9/30/26**

	Service Areas			
	1	2	3	4
	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
	Bid \$	Bid \$	Bid \$	Bid \$
Advanced	2 Advanced	1 Advanced	3 Advanced	4 Advanced
FCC	3 FCC	3 FCC	1 FCC	1 FCC
Goode	No Bid	No Bid	2 Goode	2 Goode
Republic	5 Republic	5 Republic	7 Republic	7 Republic
Richards	4 Richards	2 Richards	6 Richards	6 Richards
WM	No Bid	No Bid	5 WM	3 WM
Waste Pro	1 Waste Pro	4 Waste Pro	4 Waste Pro	5 Waste Pro
	15,494,442.24	9,900,188.72	12,135,750.44	11,257,935.27
	17,026,231.44	11,187,815.84	10,655,838.20	9,536,302.47
	23,367,278.64	14,001,618.68	18,473,986.64	15,793,230.63
	18,777,489.60	10,459,097.00	17,778,392.96	14,926,159.59
	14,964,849.84	12,194,084.24	13,716,865.64	11,999,838.15

Low Bid Tie ? NO NO NO NO NO  
Delta 529,592.40 558,908.28 487,848.24 195,958.56

Order of Award  
Low Eligible Bidder  
Award Status  
Accepted Low Bid

2 Waste Pro AWARD  
1 Advanced AWARD  
3 FCC AWARD  
4 FCC AWARD

PENDING BOARD APPROVAL ON FEBRUARY 13, 2019